

 CENTRAL BUCKS SCHOOL DISTRICT	REQUEST FOR BID # 2026-022 MUSICAL INSTRUMENT REPAIR AND MAINTENANCE Issued: July 7, 2026 Closes: July 28, 2026 10:00 A.M. SHARP	Central Bucks School District 20 Weldon Drive Doylestown, PA 18901
---	---	--

BID NAME: Musical Instrument Repair and Maintenance – Three (3) Year Contract

BID NUMBER: 2027-001

BID DUE DATE: July 28, 2026 – 10:00 A.M. SHARP

BID SECURITY REQUIREMENTS: NONE

THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTS/ITEMS MUST BE PROVIDED AS PART OF YOUR BID RESPONSE.
 FAILURE TO PROVIDE ANY OF THESE DOCUMENTS MAY DISQUALIFY YOUR BID.

- A. THIS FORM (PAGE 1), FORM OF PROPOSAL (PAGE 8) AND ANY/ALL EXCEPTIONS TO THE SPECIFICATIONS
- B. SUPPLIED BROCHURE/LITERATURE OR MANUFACTURERS CATALOG WITH BUS DETAILS
- C. COMPLETED NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

CERTIFICATION OF SIGNATURE

☒ I have checked the CBSD Bid Website for any addendums and/or questions/responses. (required)

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE PERSON SIGNING AND/OR SUBMITTING THE ATTACHED BID REQUEST TO CENTRAL BUCKS SCHOOL DISTRICT FOR:

COMPANY NAME: Music & Arts

ADDRESS: 5295 Westview Dr., Suite 300, Frederick MD 21703

DATE: 7/16/26

TELEPHONE NUMBER: (301) 620-4040

SIGNATURE (written in ink) Katherine Burns

SIGNATURE (typewritten): Katherine Burns

IS AN OWNER _____ OFFICER _____ AGENT ☒

TITLE: School Services Coordinator

AND THAT HE/SHE IS FULLY AUTHORIZED TO SUBMIT SUCH BID ON THEIR BEHALF



REQUEST FOR BID # 2026-022
MUSICAL INSTRUMENT REPAIR AND
MAINTENANCE
BID SHEET

Central Bucks School
District
20 Weldon Drive
Doylestown, PA 18901

BRASS INSTRUMENTS				
Instrument	Repair/Service	School Year 26/27	School Year 27/28	School Year 28/29
Alto/Tenor Horn	Clean & Service	\$122.40	\$122.40	\$122.40
Baritone - 3 Valve	Clean & Service	\$123.20	\$123.20	\$123.20
Baritone - 4 Valve	4 Valve Clean and Service	\$145.60	\$145.60	\$145.60
Brass	Lap Valve	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40
Brass	Pull Slide	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40
Brass	Solder Brace	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40
Brass	Solder Ferrule	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40
Cornet	Clean & Service	\$96.00	\$96.00	\$96.00
Cornet	Lacquer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Cornet	Overhaul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Euphonium	4 Valve Clean and Service	\$145.60	\$145.60	\$145.60
Euphonium	Clean & Service	\$123.20	\$123.20	\$123.20
Flugelhorn	Clean & Service	\$96.00	\$96.00	\$96.00
Flugelhorn	Overhaul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
French Horn - Double	Clean & Service (Double)	\$145.60	\$145.60	\$145.60
French Horn - Single	Clean & Service (Single)	\$122.40	\$122.40	\$122.40
Marching Brass	Clean & Service	\$123.20	\$123.20	\$123.20
Mellophone	Clean & Service	\$123.20	\$123.20	\$123.00
Brass Trombone	Double Rotor Clean & Service	\$122.40	\$122.40	\$122.40
Trombone	Single Rotor Clean & Service	\$122.40	\$122.40	\$122.40
Trombone	Single Rotor Overhaul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Trombone	Clean & Service	\$95.20	\$95.20	\$95.20
Trombone	Overhaul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Trumpet	Clean & Service	\$96.00	\$96.00	\$96.00
Trumpet	Lacquer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Trumpet	Overhaul	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Trumpet	Silver Replate	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Tuba/Sousa - 3 Valve	Clean & Service	\$158.40	\$158.40	\$158.40
Tuba/Sousa - 4 Piston	4 Piston Clean & Service	\$185.60	\$185.60	\$185.60
Tuba/Sousa - 4 Valve Rotor	4 Rotor Clean & Service	\$200.80	\$200.80	\$200.80

STRING/ORCHESTRA				
Instrument	Repair/Service	School Year 26/27	School Year 27/28	School Year 28/29
Cello	New Bridge - Cello - 3/4	\$104.80	\$104.80	\$104.80
Cello	New Nut Cello	\$96.00	\$96.00	\$96.00
Cello	Install New Peg Cello	\$52.00	\$52.00	\$52.00
Cello	New Soundpost Cello	\$55.20	\$55.20	\$55.20
Cello	Reset Soundpost Cello	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40
String Bass	New Bridge - Bass - 3/4	\$167.20	\$167.20	\$167.20
String Bass	New Nut Bass	\$80.80	\$80.80	\$80.80
String Bass	Install String Set Bass	\$46.40	\$46.40	\$46.40
String Bass	New Soundpost Bass	\$77.60	\$77.60	\$77.60
String Bass	Reset Soundpost Bass	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40
Viola - 14"	New Bridge - Viola - 14"	\$60.80	\$60.80	\$60.80
Violin	New Bridge - Violin 1/8 - 4/4	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00
Violin - 1/10	New Bridge - 1/10	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$60.00
Violin/Viola	Install String Set Violin\Viola	\$28.80	\$28.80	\$28.80
Violin/Viola	New Nut Violin\Viola	\$64.80	\$64.80	\$64.80
Violin/Viola	Install New Peg Violin\Viola	\$47.20	\$47.20	\$47.20
Violin/Viola	New Soundpost Violin\Viola	\$48.80	\$48.80	\$48.80
Violin/Viola	Reset Soundpost Violin\Viola	\$29.60	\$29.60	\$29.60
Bow	Plastic Frog Replace Cello (Add Repair)	\$52.00	\$52.00	\$52.00
Bow	Plastic Frog Replace Violin (Add Repair)	\$36.00	\$36.00	\$36.00
Bow	Grip Replace -All	\$81.60	\$81.60	\$81.60
Bow	Repair Bass Bow	\$79.20	\$79.20	\$79.20
Bow	Repair Cello Bow	\$67.20	\$67.20	\$67.20
Bow	Repair Violin\Viola	\$56.80	\$56.80	\$56.80
WOODWIND INSTRUMENTS				
Instrument	Repair/Service	School Year 26/27	School Year 27/28	School Year 28/29
Bassoon	Check & Regulate	\$94.40	\$94.40	\$94.40
Bassoon	Repair	\$136.80	\$136.80	\$136.80
Bassoon	Repair Silver Polish	\$227.20	\$227.20	\$227.20
Bassoon	Tennon cork	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40
Clarinet - Bb & A	Check & Regulate	\$61.60	\$61.60	\$61.60
Clarinet - Bb & A	Repair	\$94.40	\$94.40	\$94.40
Clarinet - Bb & A	Repair & Recork	\$94.40	\$94.40	\$94.40

WOODWIND INSTRUMENTS CONT.				
Instrument	Repair/Service	School Year 26/27	School Year 27/28	School Year 28/29
Clarinet - Bb & A	Repad Silver Polish	\$376.80	\$376.80	\$376.80
Clarinet - Alto EB	Alto Check & Regulate	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$80.00
Clarinet - Alto EB	Alto Repad	\$490.40	\$490.40	\$490.40
Clarinet - Alto EB	Alto Repad & Recork	\$490.40	\$490.40	\$490.40
Clarinet - Alto EB	Alto Repad Polish	\$580.80	\$580.80	\$580.80
Clarinet - Bass	Bass Check & Regulate	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$80.00
Clarinet - Bass	Bass Repair	\$139.20	\$139.20	\$139.20
Clarinet - Bass	Bass Repad & Recork	\$490.40	\$490.40	\$490.40
Clarinet - Bass	Bass Repad Polish	\$580.80	\$580.80	\$580.80
Clarinet - Contra	C.Bass Repad & Recork	\$558.40	\$558.40	\$558.40
Clarinet - Contra	Contra Bass Repad Polish	\$672.00	\$672.00	\$672.00
Clarinet - Contra	Contra Alto C & R	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$80.00
Clarinet - Contra	Contra Alto Repair	\$139.20	\$139.20	\$139.20
Clarinet - Contra	Contra Alto Repair & Rec	\$139.20	\$139.20	\$139.20
Clarinet - Contra	Contra Alto Repad Polish	\$672.00	\$672.00	\$672.00
Clarinet - Contra	Contra Bass C & R	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$80.00
English Horn	Check & Regulate	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$80.00
English Horn	Repad	\$448.00	\$448.00	\$448.00
English Horn	Repair & Recork	\$125.60	\$125.60	\$125.60
English Horn	Repair Silber Polish	\$216.00	\$216.00	\$216.00
English Horn	Silver Polish	\$90.40	\$90.40	\$90.40
Flute	Check & Regulate	\$61.60	\$61.60	\$61.60
Flute	Openhole Check & Regulate	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$80.00
Flute	Openhole Repad & Recork	\$316.80	\$316.80	\$316.80
Flute	Repad	\$256.00	\$256.00	\$256.00
Flute	Repair & Recork	\$94.40	\$94.40	\$94.40
Flute	Repair Openhole	\$112.80	\$112.80	\$112.80
Flute	Repair Silver Polish	\$162.40	\$162.40	\$162.40
Flute	Silver Polish	\$68.00	\$68.00	\$68.00
Oboe	Check & Regulate	\$80.00	\$80.00	\$80.00
Oboe	Repair	\$125.60	\$125.60	\$125.60
Oboe	Repad & Recork	\$448.00	\$448.00	\$448.00
Oboe	Repair Silver Polish	\$216.00	\$216.00	\$216.00
Piccolo	Check & Regulate	\$61.60	\$61.60	\$61.60
Piccolo	Repair	\$94.40	\$94.40	\$94.40
Piccolo	Repair & Recork	\$94.40	\$94.40	\$94.40
Piccolo	Repair Silver Polish	\$162.40	\$162.40	\$162.40
Piccolo	Silver Polish	\$68.00	\$68.00	\$68.00
Sax-Alto	Check & Regulate	\$87.20	\$87.20	\$87.20
Sax -Alto	Repad	\$594.40	\$594.40	\$594.40

WOODWIND INSTRUMENTS CONT.				
Instrument	Repair/Service	School Year 26/27	School Year 27/28	School Year 28/29
Sax - Alto	Repair & Recork	\$126.40	\$126.40	\$126.40
Sax -Alto	Repair Buff Keyes	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40
Sax - Baritone/Bass	Check & Regulate	\$126.40	\$126.40	\$126.40
Sax - Baritone/Bass	Repair	\$180.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
Sax - Baritone/Bass	Repair & Recork	\$180.00	\$180.00	\$180.00
Sax - Baritone/Bass	Repair Buff Keyes	\$216.80	\$216.80	\$216.80
Sax - Soprano/Nino	Check & Regulate	\$87.20	\$87.20	\$87.20
Sax - Soprano/Nino	Repair	\$126.40	\$126.40	\$126.40
Sax - Soprano/Nino	Repair & Recork	\$126.40	\$126.40	\$126.40
Sax - Soprano/Nino	Repair Buff Keys & Guard	\$216.80	\$216.80	\$216.80
Sax - Soprano/Nino	Repair Polish Silver PLA	\$138.40	\$138.40	\$138.40
Sax - Tenor	Buff Keys & Guards	\$113.60	\$113.60	\$113.60
Sax - Tenor	Check & Regulate	\$102.40	\$102.40	\$102.40
Sax - Tenor	Repair	\$153.60	\$153.60	\$153.60
Sax - Tenor	Repair & Recork	\$153.60	\$153.60	\$153.60
Sax - Tenor	Repair Buff Keys & Guard	\$267.20	\$267.20	\$267.20
Woodwind	Neck Cork	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40
Woodwind	Tenon Cork - CL/OB/PC	\$34.40	\$34.40	\$34.40